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Westminster, 1184-- in the court of King Henry, playful competition is about to turn into something far more
serious. Young courtier Fulke FitzWarin would not be an obvious companion for Prince John, but the boy
from the Welsh Marches is there as a reward for his family's loyalty to the crown. The FitzWarins are as
proud as they are true, and when Fulke is accused by John of cheating during a game of chess, he cannot help
but respond. Thus begins a bitter rivalry that will resonate throughout their lives.

The FitzWarins dream of reclaiming their family estate and title, Lords of the White Castle. After this quarrel
with Fulke, however, John's vindictiveness leads to Fulke renouncing his allegiance and becoming a rebel
outlaw.

In romance, too, Fulke is no closer to fulfilling his heart's desire. A youthful dalliance means nothing
compared to his love for the spirited Maude le Vavasour, but marriage in medieval England is more about
alliance than about love, and Fulke can only watch helplessly as Maude's father arranges a more suitable
match. After all, what can Fulke offer Maude apart from a lifetime on the run....

With all the intrigue and pageantry that bring the twelfth century vividly to life, this award-winning novelist
spins us an irresistible tale of a deadly rivalry and an impossible love.
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From reader reviews:

Alicia Mendes:

The particular book Lords of the White Castle will bring one to the new experience of reading any book. The
author style to clarify the idea is very unique. Should you try to find new book to see, this book very ideal to
you. The book Lords of the White Castle is much recommended to you to learn. You can also get the e-book
from your official web site, so you can quicker to read the book.

James Brier:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them loved ones or
their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV, or playing
video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity that's look different you can read any
book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent all day every day to
reading a reserve. The book Lords of the White Castle it is very good to read. There are a lot of people that
recommended this book. These folks were enjoying reading this book. In case you did not have enough space
to create this book you can buy the e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book from the smart
phone. The price is not very costly but this book possesses high quality.

Byron Hiebert:

Reading can called head hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book especially book entitled Lords
of the White Castle your mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every aspect that maybe
not known for but surely will end up your mind friends. Imaging each word written in a e-book then become
one web form conclusion and explanation that will maybe you never get prior to. The Lords of the White
Castle giving you another experience more than blown away your head but also giving you useful info for
your better life in this era. So now let us explain to you the relaxing pattern the following is your body and
mind will likely be pleased when you are finished reading it, like winning a casino game. Do you want to try
this extraordinary spending spare time activity?

Donald Lee:

Is it anyone who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by means of watching television programs
or just resting on the bed? Do you need something new? This Lords of the White Castle can be the answer,
oh how comes? The new book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your spare time by reading
in this new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these books have than the others?
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