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Academy Award-winning actress Huston’s “tireless fascination with the world is thrilling…” (Elle), and
Watch Me is an “elegant and entertaining” (Chicago Tribune) account of her seventeen-year love affair with
Jack Nicholson, her rise to stardom, and her mastery of the craft of acting.

Picking up where her first memoir A Story Lately Told leaves off, Watch Me is a chronicle of Anjelica
Huston’s glamorous and eventful Hollywood years. “With a conversational intimacy, inhabiting the role of
the new best friend” (San Francisco Chronicle), she writes about falling in love with Jack Nicholson and her
adventurous, turbulent, high-profile, spirited relationship with him and his intoxicating circle of friends. She
writes about learning how to act; about her Academy Award-winning portrayal of Maerose Prizzi in Prizzi’s
Honor; about her collaborations with many of the greatest directors in Hollywood, including Woody Allen,
Wes Anderson, Richard Condon, Bob Rafelson, Mike Nichols, and Stephen Frears. She movingly and
beautifully describes the death of her father John Huston and her marriage to sculptor Robert Graham. She is
candid, mischievous, warm, passionate, funny, and a fabulous storyteller. Watch Me is a magnificent memoir
“from a lady so simultaneously real, tough, vulnerable, privileged and candid, I want to hear whatever she
tells me” (Lisa Schwarzbaum, The New York Times Book Review).
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From reader reviews:

Willette Bickel:

This book untitled Watch Me: A Memoir to be one of several books this best seller in this year, honestly, that
is because when you read this guide you can get a lot of benefit in it. You will easily to buy this kind of book
in the book shop or you can order it through online. The publisher on this book sells the e-book too. It makes
you quicker to read this book, since you can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is no reason for
you to past this publication from your list.

Ruby Sprankle:

Often the book Watch Me: A Memoir will bring one to the new experience of reading some sort of book.
The author style to describe the idea is very unique. When you try to find new book to learn, this book very
suitable to you. The book Watch Me: A Memoir is much recommended to you to study. You can also get the
e-book from your official web site, so you can quickly to read the book.

Robert Alcock:

That guide can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Watch Me: A Memoir was multi-colored and of
course has pictures on there. As we know that book Watch Me: A Memoir has many kinds or variety. Start
from kids until teenagers. For example Naruto or Investigation company Conan you can read and think you
are the character on there. So , not at all of book are generally make you bored, any it can make you feel
happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best book for yourself and try to like reading in which.

Harold Bunch:

As a college student exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library or to
make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's internal or real
their interest. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to the library. They go to generally there but
nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring along with can't see
colorful images on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we know that
on this period, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, many ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore this Watch Me: A Memoir can make you really feel more interested to read.
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