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From the award-winning author of the Bad Boys of Red Hook series, a new novel about finding love
where you least expect it…

Jackson Sullivan III has always lived up to his uncle’s expectations, until his career is sidelined, leaving him
lost and in need of a retreat to his family’s cabin. But his solitude is interrupted by a beautiful visitor whose
combative feelings about the Sullivans lead Jax to a surprising declaration: he pretends to be someone else.

Though she hasn’t seen the privileged scion since she was a child, Kendall Watkins hates everything Jackson
Sullivan represents. She should know: her parents have managed the Sullivan estate for years. In need of her
own peace and quiet, she heads to the cabin, never expecting to come face to face with the most handsome
man she’s ever met. Soon stranded by a violent nor’easter, Jax and Kendall end up sharing more than they
dreamed. But Jax knows that when the storm clears, his true identity will be revealed, and Kendall will be
left with a betrayal that may be too great to forgive…
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From reader reviews:

Warren Johnson:

Book is written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can learn everything you want by a book. Book has
a different type. As you may know that book is important thing to bring us around the world. Close to that
you can your reading skill was fluently. A reserve Home to You will make you to always be smarter. You
can feel more confidence if you can know about almost everything. But some of you think that open or
reading the book make you bored. It is not necessarily make you fun. Why they might be thought like that?
Have you looking for best book or ideal book with you?

Cecil Atkins:

What do you regarding book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you need
something to explain what the ones you have problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy
particular person? If you don't have spare time to do others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored
faster. And you have extra time? What did you do? All people has many questions above. They need to
answer that question mainly because just their can do this. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar on
every person. Yes, it is correct. Because start from on guardería until university need this kind of Home to
You to read.

Steven Dillinger:

Reading a book for being new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to study a book. When you
learn a book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge, due
to the fact book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what types of
book that you have read. If you wish to get information about your research, you can read education books,
but if you act like you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, such us novel, comics, in
addition to soon. The Home to You provide you with a new experience in reading a book.

Richard Manning:

You may spend your free time to read this book this guide. This Home to You is simple to create you can
read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train in addition to soon. If you did not have got much space to
bring the printed book, you can buy the actual e-book. It is make you simpler to read it. You can save often
the book in your smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.
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