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Edward FitzGerald’s translation of the Rubáiyát of Omar Khayyám, perhaps the most frequently read
Victorian poem and certainly one of the most popular poems in the English language, poses formidable
challenges to an editor. FitzGerald compulsively revised his work, alternately swayed by friends’ advice,
importuned by his publisher’s commercial interests, and encouraged by public acclaim. In consequence, the
editor is faced with four published editions as well as manuscript and proof versions of the poem.
Christopher Decker’s critical edition of the Rubáiyát is the first to publish all extant states of the poem and to
unearth a full record of its complicated textual evolution.

Decker supplies a rich interpretive context for the Rubáiyát that reveals how its composition was so often a
collaborative enterprise. His view of poetic creativity comprehends recent theories of the sociology of texts
and challenges the common assumption that the desired product of a critical edition is a single unified text of
a literary work. He illuminates the complex process of revision by providing a textual appendix in which a
comparative printing lays down each stratum of FitzGerald’s composition. Biographical and textual
introductions, making imaginative use of FitzGerald’s correspondence, trace the history of the poem and pay
special attention to FitzGerald’s motives for revising, for creating a variously beautiful work in verse.

This definitive edition of the Rubáiyát will be of special interest to scholars and students of Victorian poetry,
publishing history, verse translation, literary imitation, and revision. And readers for whom the poem is an
old acquaintance will here find fresh ways to appreciate its strengths and finesse.
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From reader reviews:

Norman Eiland:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a information or any news even restricted. What people must be
consider if those information which is inside the former life are difficult to be find than now could be taking
seriously which one is appropriate to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you receive
the unstable resource then you obtain it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All
of those possibilities will not happen inside you if you take Rubáiyát of Omar Khayyám: A Critical Edition
(Victorian Literature and Culture Series) as the daily resource information.

Keiko Whitchurch:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With examining you can get a lot of
information that will give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world can certainly share their
idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire their very own reader with their story
or maybe their experience. Not only situation that share in the books. But also they write about advantage
about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your kids, there are
many kinds of book that exist now. The authors these days always try to improve their proficiency in writing,
they also doing some analysis before they write to their book. One of them is this Rubáiyát of Omar
Khayyám: A Critical Edition (Victorian Literature and Culture Series).

Edward Suniga:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many issue for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people
likes reading through, not only science book but also novel and Rubáiyát of Omar Khayyám: A Critical
Edition (Victorian Literature and Culture Series) or others sources were given understanding for you. After
you know how the fantastic a book, you feel want to read more and more. Science guide was created for
teacher as well as students especially. Those ebooks are helping them to add their knowledge. In additional
case, beside science reserve, any other book likes Rubáiyát of Omar Khayyám: A Critical Edition (Victorian
Literature and Culture Series) to make your spare time more colorful. Many types of book like here.

Mary Kidd:

A lot of guide has printed but it is unique. You can get it by online on social media. You can choose the most
beneficial book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It is identified as
of book Rubáiyát of Omar Khayyám: A Critical Edition (Victorian Literature and Culture Series). You can
include your knowledge by it. Without causing the printed book, it might add your knowledge and make an
individual happier to read. It is most important that, you must aware about e-book. It can bring you from one
location to other place.
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