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The history of American environmentalism is the history of men and women who dedicated their lives to
protecting the nation’s natural heritage. Almost singlehandedly, John James Audubon introduced the study of
birds in North America. John Muir pushed a president and a nation into setting aside vast preserves,
including Yosemite, Sequoia, Mt. Rainier, and the Grand Canyon. Marjory Stoneman Douglas did the same
for the Florida Everglades, as did Mardy Murie with the Grand Tetons and the Arctic National Wildlife
Refuge. Cordelia Stanwood, and later Roger Peterson, revolutionized and popularized birdwatching. Rachel
Carson opened the world’s eyes to the dangers of pesticides, and Julia “Butterfly” Hill saved a 1,000-year-
old redwood while bringing to light the devastation of our old growth forests. Together, these
environmentalists' inspiring life stories tell the story of American environmentalism, from its inception to the
present day.
            In Friends of Our Earth readers will also learn how to put their concerns into action. Author Pat
McCarthy gives step-by-step instructions on how to build a birdfeeder, conduct a water quality survey, start a
compost pile, study the Greenhouse Effect, make plaster casts of animals tracks, create their own recycled
paper, test for acid rain, and more. It includes a time line of historic milestones, popular outdoor parks and
sites to visit or explore online, and Web resources for further study.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Barrientes:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your problem; you can add
your knowledge by the publication entitled Friends of the Earth: A History of American Environmentalism
with 21 Activities (For Kids series). Try to stumble through book Friends of the Earth: A History of
American Environmentalism with 21 Activities (For Kids series) as your good friend. It means that it can to
get your friend when you feel alone and beside those of course make you smarter than previously. Yeah, it is
very fortuned to suit your needs. The book makes you considerably more confidence because you can know
almost everything by the book. So , we should make new experience in addition to knowledge with this
book.

Kevin Blais:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their down time with their family,
or their particular friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, likely to beach, or
picnic inside park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Will you something different
to fill your personal free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book can be option to fill your free of charge time/
holiday. The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If you want to
consider look for book, may be the guide untitled Friends of the Earth: A History of American
Environmentalism with 21 Activities (For Kids series) can be fine book to read. May be it is usually best
activity to you.

Randy Caldera:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always try and and must have the spare time or they will get lot
of stress from both way of life and work. So , once we ask do people have extra time, we will say absolutely
of course. People is human not just a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity have you got when
the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer may unlimited right. Then ever try this one,
reading textbooks. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, the book you have read is
definitely Friends of the Earth: A History of American Environmentalism with 21 Activities (For Kids
series).

Solange Smith:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you will get it in
e-book technique, more simple and reachable. This Friends of the Earth: A History of American
Environmentalism with 21 Activities (For Kids series) can give you a lot of pals because by you looking at
this one book you have thing that they don't and make you more like an interesting person. This kind of book
can be one of one step for you to get success. This guide offer you information that possibly your friend



doesn't learn, by knowing more than other make you to be great individuals. So , why hesitate? Let's have
Friends of the Earth: A History of American Environmentalism with 21 Activities (For Kids series).
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