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The bestselling author of The Object of My Affection and True Enough delivers his most compelling and
richly observed novel to date with this portrait of one man's search for the holy trinity of modern life -- true
love, good sex, and great real estate.

Stephen McCauley's new novel is a moving and hilarious chronicle of life in post-traumatic, morally
ambiguous America where the desire to do good is constantly being tripped up by the need to feel good.
Right now.

William Collins is a real estate agent working near Boston. Despite a boom market, his sales figures aren't
what they should be, due mostly to the distractions of compulsive ironing and housecleaning binges and his
penchant for nightly online cruising for hookups -- "less impersonal than old-fashioned anonymous sex
because you exchanged fake names with the person."

There's also his struggle to collect the rent from Kumiko Rothberg, his passive-aggressive tenant, and his
worries about his best friend, Edward, a flight attendant he's certainly not in love with.

William has known for some time that his habits are slipping out of control. But he figures that "as long as I
acknowledged my behavior was a problem, it wasn't one."

When he finally decides to do something about his life, he needs a role model of calm stability. Enter
Charlotte O'Malley and Samuel Thompson, wealthy suburbanites looking for the perfect city apartment.
"Happy couple," William writes in his notes. "Maybe I can learn something from them." But what he learns
challenges his own assumptions about real estate, love, and desire. And what they learn from him might
unravel a budding friendship, not to mention a very promising sale.

Full of crackling dialogue delivered by a stellar ensemble of players, Alternatives to Sex is social satire at its
very best: A smart, sophisticated, and astonishingly funny look at the way we live now.
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From reader reviews:

Samuel Stratton:

The book Alternatives to Sex: A Novel can give more knowledge and information about everything you
want. Exactly why must we leave the great thing like a book Alternatives to Sex: A Novel? Several of you
have a different opinion about e-book. But one aim that book can give many data for us. It is absolutely
correct. Right now, try to closer together with your book. Knowledge or info that you take for that, you could
give for each other; you are able to share all of these. Book Alternatives to Sex: A Novel has simple shape
but you know: it has great and massive function for you. You can look the enormous world by available and
read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Carla McFarlin:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive right now,
people have do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and
notice through surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated it for a while is
reading. That's why, by reading a publication your ability to survive increase then having chance to endure
than other is high. For you personally who want to start reading any book, we give you this specific
Alternatives to Sex: A Novel book as beginning and daily reading book. Why, because this book is more
than just a book.

Theresa Braun:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make someone
to understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information easier to share.
You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and soon.
You can observe that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The particular book that
recommended to you is Alternatives to Sex: A Novel this publication consist a lot of the information of the
condition of this world now. This specific book was represented how do the world has grown up. The words
styles that writer require to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some investigation when
he makes this book. This is why this book acceptable all of you.

Lorene Williamson:

A lot of e-book has printed but it differs. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the very
best book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It is known as of book
Alternatives to Sex: A Novel. You can include your knowledge by it. Without causing the printed book, it
can add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most essential that, you must aware about e-
book. It can bring you from one spot to other place.
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