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Ludwig II, the Fairy-tale King of Bavaria, is today remembered for his beautiful castles—popular tourist
destinations that inspired the Disney Castle, but whose origins were much more fantastical than anything
Disney could dream up. Also known as the Mad King, Ludwig was deposed in 1886 after being declared
insane by doctors who had never met him. He promptly died—mysteriously drowned in waist-deep
water—his eccentric castles his only legacy.

Master of historical suspense Oliver Pötzsch brings the Mad King back to life in The Ludwig Conspiracy.
An encoded diary by one of Ludwig’s confidants falls into the hands of modern-day rare book dealer Steven
Lukas, who soon realizes that the diary may bring him more misery than money. Others want the diary as
well—and they will kill to get it. Lukas teams up with a beautiful art detective, Sara Lengfeld, to investigate
each of Ludwig’s three famous castles for clues to crack the diary’s code as mysterious thugs and Ludwig’s
fanatical followers chase them at every step. Just what in the diary could be so explosive?

Combining contemporary mystery and a gripping historical saga and centered on an ingenious code that can
be cracked only with a combination of modern computers and nineteenth-century texts, The Ludwig
Conspiracy is a bold new thriller from the best-selling author of The Hangman’s Daughter series.
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From reader reviews:

Gerard Brand:

This The Ludwig Conspiracy are usually reliable for you who want to become a successful person, why. The
reason why of this The Ludwig Conspiracy can be one of several great books you must have will be giving
you more than just simple looking at food but feed anyone with information that maybe will shock your
earlier knowledge. This book is definitely handy, you can bring it almost everywhere and whenever your
conditions in e-book and printed kinds. Beside that this The Ludwig Conspiracy forcing you to have an
enormous of experience for instance rich vocabulary, giving you trial of critical thinking that we all know it
useful in your day activity. So , let's have it appreciate reading.

Angela Jones:

The book with title The Ludwig Conspiracy posesses a lot of information that you can find out it. You can
get a lot of help after read this book. That book exist new information the information that exist in this
reserve represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to yo7u to learn how the
improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you in new era of the the positive effect. You can
read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you want.

Frederick Avelar:

Why? Because this The Ludwig Conspiracy is an unordinary book that the inside of the book waiting for you
to snap that but latter it will jolt you with the secret the idea inside. Reading this book alongside it was
fantastic author who have write the book in such amazing way makes the content inside of easier to
understand, entertaining way but still convey the meaning entirely. So , it is good for you because of not
hesitating having this nowadays or you going to regret it. This phenomenal book will give you a lot of gains
than the other book have got such as help improving your proficiency and your critical thinking technique.
So , still want to delay having that book? If I were being you I will go to the e-book store hurriedly.

Kristin Sayler:

Reading a book to get new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to study a book. When you
learn a book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge,
mainly because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds
of book that you have read. If you need to get information about your study, you can read education books,
but if you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, and soon. The
The Ludwig Conspiracy offer you a new experience in reading through a book.
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