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Spring, summer, fall, and winter, Smitten is a place for love  . . . and mystery.

But master gardener Clare Thomas is about to dig up something surprising.

There’s a secret in Grandma Rose’s attic—a forgotten set of dog tags belonging to her first love. But David
Hutchins was killed in action and never returned to town. How did the dog tags end up in the Grandma’s
attic? It’s a romantic mystery fit for a town like Smitten, Vermont, which has been working hard to reinvent
itself as a destination for lovers. Rose’s three granddaughters are determined to investigate, though their
mother Anna has reservations about digging up the past. But will they get distracted by mystery men of their
own before they solve the puzzle of the dogtags?

In Love Blooms, Clare is really, really tired of being called predictable, which is why she decides to gives a
job at her nursery to the scruffy vagabond on a motorcycle. Is trusting her instincts the most foolish thing
she’s ever done . . . or the smartest?

Excerpted from Secretly Smitten, a novel in four parts written by Inspirational fiction’s most popular
romance novelists—and real life BFFs!
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From reader reviews:

Ken Martin:

Book is definitely written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can learn everything you want by a e-
book. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important matter to bring us around the world.
Alongside that you can your reading skill was fluently. A guide Love Blooms: A Smitten Novella will make
you to become smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know about everything. But some of
you think that open or reading any book make you bored. It's not make you fun. Why they are often thought
like that? Have you looking for best book or suited book with you?

Ann Clark:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind skill or
thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book in comparison with
can satisfy your short time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find guide that need more
time to be learn. Love Blooms: A Smitten Novella can be your answer given it can be read by anyone who
have those short free time problems.

Jon Watson:

Is it an individual who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by means of watching television
programs or just lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This Love Blooms: A Smitten
Novella can be the solution, oh how comes? A book you know. You are and so out of date, spending your
time by reading in this brand new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these guides have than the
others?

Timothy Wrobel:

Some individuals said that they feel uninterested when they reading a guide. They are directly felt it when
they get a half parts of the book. You can choose often the book Love Blooms: A Smitten Novella to make
your current reading is interesting. Your own personal skill of reading skill is developing when you including
reading. Try to choose simple book to make you enjoy to learn it and mingle the sensation about book and
reading especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to open up a book and examine it. Beside that the
guide Love Blooms: A Smitten Novella can to be your new friend when you're feel alone and confuse with
what must you're doing of the time.
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