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In their personal lives, people consider it essential to separate economics and intimacy. We have, for
example, a long-standing taboo against workplace romance, while we see marital love as different from
prostitution because it is not a fundamentally financial exchange. In The Purchase of Intimacy, Viviana
Zelizer mounts a provocative challenge to this view. Getting to the heart of one of life's greatest taboos, she
shows how we all use economic activity to create, maintain, and renegotiate important ties--especially
intimate ties--to other people.

In everyday life, we invest intense effort and worry to strike the right balance. For example, when a wife's
income equals or surpasses her husband's, how much more time should the man devote to household chores
or child care? Sometimes legal disputes arise. Should the surviving partner in a same-sex relationship have
received compensation for a partner's death as a result of 9/11?

Through a host of compelling examples, Zelizer shows us why price is central to three key areas of intimacy:
sexually tinged relations; health care by family members, friends, and professionals; and household
economics. She draws both on research and materials ranging from reports on compensation to survivors of
9/11 victims to financial management Web sites and advice books for same-sex couples.

From the bedroom to the courtroom, The Purchase of Intimacy opens a fascinating new window on the inner
workings of the economic processes that pervade our private lives.
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From reader reviews:

Verna Smith:

The book with title The Purchase of Intimacy contains a lot of information that you can discover it. You can
get a lot of advantage after read this book. This particular book exist new understanding the information that
exist in this publication represented the condition of the world right now. That is important to yo7u to know
how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you with new era of the syndication. You
can read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you want.

Alfred Wolff:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with close friends is thing that
usually you might have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try factor that really
opposite from that. 1 activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you have been ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love The Purchase of Intimacy, you
can enjoy both. It is excellent combination right, you still wish to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh
seriously its mind hangout folks. What? Still don't have it, oh come on its named reading friends.

Derrick Minor:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a e-book we can
know everything we really wish for. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet.
Every year seemed to be exactly added. This reserve The Purchase of Intimacy was filled regarding science.
Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your technology competence. Some people has various
feel when they reading a new book. If you know how big benefit from a book, you can sense enjoy to read a
e-book. In the modern era like today, many ways to get book that you just wanted.

Aurora Ammon:

That book can make you to feel relax. This kind of book The Purchase of Intimacy was multi-colored and of
course has pictures on the website. As we know that book The Purchase of Intimacy has many kinds or
category. Start from kids until teens. For example Naruto or Detective Conan you can read and think that you
are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book usually are make you bored, any it makes you feel
happy, fun and loosen up. Try to choose the best book for you personally and try to like reading that.
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